RNI No. MAHBIL /2009/35530

g ¥, IF ¥Y] WHAR, ATRE R, R0%¢/SA@UT IR, IH R¥o [U=s ¢, fFma : F9@ R3.00

SMTIRUT HHE ¢\9
TTTehe ThTI
TR faurrice™ fufam T TCAUmEi-t TEAiT doet AR F held fafTan.
STehATUTRT

9

| R0%¢ T WERTE AfUfa9 FHI% W¥.— TERME TMiaRd e ad o gEron TS

FOGMEET 3. 2-¢

S ¢ 3R 08¢ TS AT, ISFUAHT T Tete HeRTe faumdeesmn e sitatHay Afedran!, aER, Ueg
HIOA I AR,

T[EE T, WATE,
TR |rea (Tafy faem),
TERT I,
fafa @ = favm.

| R0%¢ AT HERTE AW HHE Q6.
(1. TEUTEATE WA TSR “ WERTE, 9= TSI~ {67 23 SR 03¢ TSt HI Ui shefell Siraf-=e.)

TR JWuEe Afafad o Aot gemon wvvararet i,

Ro%0 T ST, HERTSZ=T TSIt HeRTSE. THUERd (YR TR, 020 (A AT9E S
HeT.

s, e, IG%1 “ SHA LAY ST FIUA Al 3R) BT ik 22 et 0219 ST WA hedl el ;
foT SaTeRedt, fSAih % S[ot R0 IS I faumTEeT SEvE TR GE SedeR,
ST TR T [FeHESAAT S TR FRUAIS TR THu=rId (GERom) fagess,
R0% (| R0 T fouras fauas FHi® &) (I Age aran e « 3o faeaes ” o
FHIOATT 3T 31E) &, TERTL [TEHISd ik o 3RS 0% IS WA 31t i ;
()

T AR—L9-R



WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e

arfor Sarerell, AHM TERTE At feAis 2% SRe 0% IS T THIC! Seares
TeRTe faumayd ST fa8gs Tod &% el Al ;

FfuT ST, WRAren SiouEe S R3(R)(F) FEd WIS HedmHl, KA
3 U R0\ ST I 3TEARI AT STHUAT o5 BT 3T

ot SATSRelt, ST STARITEAT RS A STHUAT TIe] AU T AL ghl; S,
UM, HERTTAT IUEA! £ W@k 0% IS FERTE Aru=mad (JuROT & g =] 3a9)
STEATIIT, 02\ (AT ATIE ST ST “ I TM6] S0 STEARI ? 3T FRUATT AT 3T) & T
et Bl ;

anfur rerell, AT 22 fedeR 02w ST I foumHear e T=T & SeImeR,
3FT foeEe 2, HerTe faemays fGAiw ] fedar 020 TS GURUTEE 9T el g 37T o
HeRTE {TINESHhs TRIYT H0aTd 3Tt &1 ;

ot waerell, S [T s HeRTe Ui i 3 Tedar 2020 ST STURE gERue
THT et B ;

afoT reredt, HeRTe faemuRess 3o g heledT GURON, TeRTE faumaeds foard
HUATET, faEmae SiyeeETE i IR fedar 0% TS W FHIG! e

afor Seeredt, YRdre GiaumeT SER R03(R)(F) A AR heATH, IF T
T TR T AT 2 STHART 08¢ X 06T STHuar 5 2ot 3T ;
ATHIS FIAATE! FIO! ST 3TEvad @1a SN URFEI SR STHeaeEe et Qe ueelt
&I ; afor, T, T f§iR R0 STHERT R02¢ IS HERTSE THTEEA (FUROT 9 Te 1] 3907
ST, R02¢ (T AE SATAT ST “ Y TTe] AT STEARE, 08¢ 7 T HIUATT AT 3TE) &
TR el il ;

anfur Savetell, ST qE TI6] SaU STEAIRY, R0%¢ AT Y faumHearET Sityfama SR
O T 3R ; AT, AR ORI STSHRIAT au, ARN, [Eier i g I 318 —

e e % () & Syl HERTS Tt (YEROM) AUFEH, 080 - wUME,
e (R) a, fei® 2] et 0% ST STHAATT STEl ST THUA I8,
T QU = . TR UHUEEd U= (I Ae Jren M « g siiufa » 31 wvard STer
T FAT o) Arer e 3 Hel—
3 T F 3
= gemom. (F) T (3737 TR, @1 T THITE FUITT I :—
«(R2373737) “ TR ” AT 31 HoW L2 ST TEEE We WU FecRic
fags sTcie demd 98w, ST 3T 3707 T Hetd 3037-237 3T Uamdid 9
Harg eTetean TRuwmET st gt ; 7 ;
(@) @S (R9) A “FHoM 3o” I ATGIAR, “, 3037-237” B AL GANTL
FHUAT T
T 2]uR =T 3. T AfufEE S © ge, de-der™ (3) AR, el Yie-shetd I v
STyt FHih Aot —

3 T FAF
= RO,

«(337) S e TRUE et 3037-237 3T g¢ Mag fXeiel o/iet o7en demdren
T, A1 MU ST GRS Shelt et R, TemdieaT Yo | HaguphHae=r
BT T AT ST TS 3T ST AT SR 3U-TRU ST
3T ; VT TUT F I-TRUT AT Srerear SR, THAEAT T T SURd STete,

RoRg =T

3. ¢,

Roqe =

3. R,

RuR =



WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e 3

T A, o TG Ueh TSTSHTEAT HIATTAES! Tahel HIvard Aget, ToT 37em
TEFAHR T2T SRITUITT STeiedT THAHET ST GIUT 3T STMUT = STuferd
SU-TRUT ST 3T 5 ST TWUT F 3Y-TRUF I7 A SFareerd, Taae=n
T YT SURAT G, IAM ol WS IR UEaT 9o STl 9.
3TN T e HIvTTR! WE IR e T T [geh STeh=ae @i T
¥. T YA Fem o WA, WE-detd (R) AX, UEId Ul-hoiH HHa 9 4l

FIOEE . i shafE
A = 3 AT el

“(R37) AT UAEAET WUE FOTH 303T-23T O 9T ST ST et STRN %o W GERO.
UATIATeAT GEHTd, AT FHorHTel RS e EsidE AN ST, qie-serd () =
Tg (37) A, 3U-Ts (Th) =1 &, @i SU-TE UL FI0Ad It :—

“« (TH-37) FHAH 303723 T HASA elen WU — URMHE T ;

W, T STufTEETE Fed 23 94, de-werm (2) 7 (R) Ueel, [t die-derm arae WF ;M =
FHOATT AATA — o

3 ITAT hetH

“(R) AARR AR Ta A Teeh oIkl a1 STaAETel foham o @ dedl et &3 = garom.
AT TR HIVIATE! FIRETIA FRE STetett TeT R, TR I&T AT THAMTHE T 3Tt
T TR AT, ST O W FHaee e demdie wRudren gt
AT IO 376 3T

() TEF AR FHASUERERRAT fohaT Tie-FHereumirRar T sRuarel Head
HeIe AT TG AAGR FRIT A9 STEerel U7 }2 a¥E HH a7 "gciel Yeih
et a1 ATFTEEETe! fohar @ T St ST STEeiedl o’ IVl ShIEEEel FRE
XA YA TR, T AT FHIVITET THFTIIE! ST Gareedrear TRue qemme! oA FHagd
YUY STE Y. M AT AAGR AR 59 A1 ASavare et 9et 319 hivTater
A T TETEAT VTR TG S0 Tareen WU USTehal Fag Juarg 37
TR ATTeY.

(R37) TIh T FESUhIshRAT fohal Wie-MHasuhiehRaT THSY SRuardre! FHivad
Shotedn ifam femTeRT, I2 TuigH HH A THA, 0T 59 AARR=AT I&id A9 3R,
anfoT ST { STHERT 2]]Y TS fehal SIHR STHeiell 3/ 8eT offoT fSTerr ar stfuf-ammarert
foham o 1 It ST STATAT TR VAR FIREGRITA X8 A T8 ST Uik
T, ToeameRs fohm Smer ferefomdier \walt sat TRieT Tl SeTe TS STHeATERIs
fopar T T TTeRT=a SRTTOT SheaTorTor \oall el THdes SIeTTh 3TeaT STHearaiST,

& U U Herd y Tl die-werd () Hed,— T 288 T
() s (1) Tfer, s () ke S A RIS < A o

BT ISTRY JTEeT HXUAT AT ; Ry < RO
(FF) e () wel, “urg gufen” a1 AEuas, « Wel aurdr” g 6ol IR

FUA IEeT.

. T IUHIETEAT FHE 24 Tl Uie-Serd (R) e, “HoH 27 AT ASHIHR, T 2]uR =

e . ATae FHHh
Topar, Zrenfead, e 3037-2317, 1 TS JRIST 0T L. < e o

Y = gURoT.

T IR—C9-3



G RjuR =
A= FHTH

WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e

¢. TF SUHIETAT Fed L& T Te-derd () Ted, “IoT W 7 g ASTR S

3 e o A TSRV ST S N S1e! TSROl couarol, « SRt » &1 HofehY el STeHITeh HhRIE,
%6 Tl RO gyt speoaTd Aga.

G RUR =
At =T FHiR

R. T IUHAHMA FerH R TEET Tie-derd () T, “ At ISI-MT Greaamhe s

3 o Ferm P AT FEHIGES, « Al TSI W1 Kediean 37 |fearhe it e ” 81 Horgd arad
R8T PR, poaer et

G RjuR =
A= ST

Ro. T MU FEW 3o WA, Uie-He (1) AR, YEIAT UlR-FHeH THIES

3 FreT e PO AL

30 T RO,

T R_uR =
A= FHTH
3 g S
3037-237
YT IOt
LT 92
[REEUE

“(237) 7 dEECrET WU, HoH 3037-237 3T 9 faeA oo e awm
TR T AT eI TRl e FEReldE AN STret i—
(%) G-t () UaST, Geiet We-hetd SRIeT HIvdTd Jgel (—
“ () Wieeh TR STEARTEl WO Y. 7 ;

(@) T () BV FEe ;

(M) Ue-FHeH (¥) T < TG 9 el damEdren waaren geme
TEICTIEIOT IS ST STl ” AT HeTepRuast, « erirame! o et damEdme
TUFTEAT URT STREUT § EICTHHI0 STeT ” &1 ATy JREel FivaTd I5et. 7.

R. T AEATEA FHeH 30 AR, YR o T FI0I e, —

“ 3037-R3A. (2) HERT UTUARd (FERUT) TFHH, 0%\ I TR KATRHR,
ST JEEdre et HaSueh SHEare Sed o YAl aedid werd 30 €
e-Fer® (%), (W) T (&) I TAIMAT T e Tedish TR Uk TR 3Tt S7eT,
O R WA TFTERICe] HaR ARG S T1d GHla SFier, ST el g
feeiet e,

() TR WA aeuReRieRe GeueT s Juard Jge ST et
THereuTs SUaTEl SIS, ST FASuER AT @ HRRIEE ] 3.

(3) THerevEm J&! HIVEr W™ FHaee o ARl ), Wi Hasvamet T=m
ek Svarg At ST M HdeiedT HaSuhHEE WU e el ARl @,
3T o ST, a1 SMiUfEmId PRl Ay 3Tel adl, e STeledn U TewiER
AT HASUEhIER SRUGT At ST AT Hie-Shormrar Hag Keledn axu=rar qamaHt
&1, e HEEeAT UsTed! g 3.

(¥) Uie-Fem (3) 3T FagH STelel SV St &, a7 FHorrad Faguenme
eI HegA el STaeard qHvard gt

(W) TRUATEAT HaguRld THaqE T USell o), Maguenan e, 59 Hasus
STIFRER fehall e JasTTe @ FgerT shetedn STaeR=amaR, faaeen 2rha SXfauard Jge.

Ro%¢ =.

WY,



WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e Y

(&) U= FASURIEEH! HIvTaR! fars HufT Sear™, @EE Serd 2y =
TR AT T FRERGE AT Bret. 7.

. TTA SNUEHIAT Hotd 3037 T, T 2]uR =
el shafE

(F) Te-Herd () R, eIt Te-Hhotd THIEE HUI JgeT i— 3 e e
3037 T FEROT.

« (237) g7 U WU A fae ot ST8e wn YadeT SeHd T
Hrahre HMaguERFTR SUar JTeiedl Ueedl FHwed 30 XU Haeuh Juad A5 ;

(@) Te-FHem () TR, TEiT Tie-Hetd ST&T IRIS HI0AT AT :—

«(R31) <A1 YA WUE 42 TagA Kool ¥ @ e Sey,
3T TRUTAT T He 30 AT Tie-FHod (3) =1 TR AT &N WIERIFE AN

3. A SMuFEErA wem 33 W, die-dem (W) AW, TR die-shor SEiae O 2jus W
sfafTa s
FIUAT A 1 — 3 T Fom

= RO,

“ (&) ST YETICET WU, A7 SUFEETEAT e 3031-237 Y U THagA fKeten ¥
3 T YAIAT T AT FHeHTAT TAal, Jeiet PRageliae o] STt (—
(%) ie-Her () T « [RAT 9 3T TWUF AT FaSuehiame! ” &1 oeige 1
3 Taerott STt 318 @ Siet foeholt mast « 30 TRUEre HaguEhaTe! 7 8 AeieR
IR HIUATT A
(@) Tie-Ferm () AR, Y@ Ue-FHotd FHIOE FHI0A e - —
“(237) AT AU FHOH 3037-237 T TWIRTAR TRA=rE HaSIH

(M) Ue-FeT () T “ U FeATEH e hRl STRIMER A&Ted ” a0
TTERTUEST QU ST WU @hRie, Tuard U8 Rerd 37et R Soaitaenr
STRTMER AT ” BT AP I FHIvITe I ;

(F) de-Fwem (3) A ““wRUT T 7T IS ISTA AT ;
() Uie-Fem (¥) Uastt, Y@l Uie-FHerd IE@el HRuad Jget i —
“(%) 3u-TRUETE euRE SRR A TSer edEre o
Td IJUATET Tk TS ST TR U8 Ko 31, @ FHagunan e,
terde st i e s G e awet fagt 2 doam a5, 7,
() We-FeT (4) T, —
(Tep) “* TR fohar 7 B AT ASTET AE
(SF) ““ 379N |e=AT ST Seied AT el W
R¥. T AMMEHTEA FHeW 34 TE, Te-Fhom (1) TR, Tt Te-Shotd THITRE Hua & 2]u] =

. i shafE
Rk 3 Il HAH

“(37) <ot WXOE AT ST S 3031-237 ST 92 e faeten 34 T GEROT.
3T ST U e, AT HoTHrel TRaal Jeiel Siasetidg ol STt i—




& WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e

(EF) W‘W (2) tﬁﬁ’ “QTzﬁ-thWﬁg:n” a0 W@Eﬁﬁ, ua:‘__ ﬁ S

BT ASTHR 3TEeT 0T AT
(@) de-Fem (3) 7L, —

“ = dR AT HIE! HT 7 A A GE ST S
“ 3q-grdETeRe fAfed eidic 7 A1 AR STt HhRes!, Qe e SrEe
Wﬁ?ﬁ?{:—

“ =1 T dost YEACeAT VARl Y SURYd J@vArl o ST g9k
AT TS W FIUATT AT 3T 30T, o= a1yt e
SHeTodT TTTHT=ATeAT THe STV AT STegeToRaTetict fay AT FHEHR e AASHER
T SR TR ST fSett STt @, W fohar, Fenfed, Su-aRde @ gereAr
I AFHRIET AR FIOAE o @ FF T e UR TEUATT dEede gigare

SMOT SR AT T WU [o5g A 0T 3T 3Tl ol ey
Y ARIHR, A T el IY-GLoETRE FEd g, 7 ;

() =T WS, JeleT Wk SRgel HIuaT Ieiel (—
“ Wiq qHE, WUEreAT el SU-SRuEreAT HeSuhteAT KA g9 anter
3T 37T SHIUTATE! STaTaTaT JRdTal ST AR ARl
T 2]uR W 4. T SUMHIHMA Fe 3¢ Tl Uie-sed (R) A, WE (TH) AR, R TS
WWWWW:—

ATAT heTH
3ia°rﬁwtrn. “ (ush-37) ST YAECrEr GIOE AT ST ey 3037-237 3T 92 MagT feen
3T 3TN U= Heend of WU Yl SAThRian Wit AR FHifet TvT Gelet Fr
T HAd IR UTESHeT,—
(37) e wyie S sfan w9 37

THTAYT FIUFTE HOTON AT R, TRUT AF FIVIAET e G THAT HRgE FHIea
A -

T UG 3T I, HIVIE! SHITAIR O ST € STUNT g ST
AN =TeAfael SO @Y

W a9, SR U Hd, GarEdrer Shiomerel [oaareRiet 3k 81 &1 MEreA A
TEaTe ek SXURT ST R, TR, A 3E Tt Jelet Tmaeqe ifam Fommmet
STATE T FRIA ST ATERe Aaa i sifay 38 ;
(&) TEEdr anfieh JFEeTIseh daR 0l ;
(F) TRl [TERfEaHTa FEA, AT TEEUaEE! TR FE STEHRET am
;7
T j]UR R&. U SUMHIETEAT FeH 3R N We-He () HH “ U a9 7 A1 HSiepast

ST FHD « g7 g ” g7 T TEel 0T .
3 AT HeH

3R = gErom.




WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e 9

Ro. T AYFREETEAT Hem 3 T Uie-sherd (1) WA, TR Wb Yeiel T T 2uR T

e SEgeT HI0ATT AseT i — . A

“ T AU 3T, T AT Ye-homrad No etel 9 Faited aerd ug, o e ¥3 =i gemon.
AT ARG el Aie—aTedT HITaeear 3T, Hetd 3037-237 =1 Uie-herd () Ted

R¢. TS FEMERTAT FHod ¥R T qie-wom (%) Heler T, — T 2Rug
(T) T (31) =1 3], qera @ HHiae HIvan I5ct i— mﬁT
“ (3% %) W a1 e wERAE ST R ;7 ¥S = R
(3F) @e (F) R, e TS TS FH0AT Aot i—
“ (1) TmHE B e s gee-aeg e, 7
R. A SFEHTAT FAT &R T, Ue-Hem (2) AR, et Tie-For HHNTRE FUGR T 2348 =
G M= A

3 IreAT ShelH
“ (R373Y) S VIR TR, A7 SAEFEEAT et 3037237 e 92 FHagd feetoen &R I GERO.

WWWW1QTWWWWWW:—

(F) re-Fe® (R) 7 (237) TS YRt Uie-shorH TN FI0I AdeT —

“(2) WU ot fafed SRUATT FeT ST T FTRVIER ST SreeeeT
THAT TAF T & STHART ISt TR wrgat FeEiia et :—

(37) FeideT TRIve Rieeish a Jeial foxiia asTame! demdret sfaiid e ;

(F) TGRS T FHeTH ¥4 S Sl Fied TR TSTARTE! ATelell & ;

(%) T 233 3T T hetedT Seel AR Hefien amerme SR
IFhH

(3) @ (31), () b, wfeald, (%) R TR Hetel foRor o=
TAEAEAR 3T ;

() AT 3o foeRuETaaeA e RIERSIAT 3% STHart fhar @mgdr sifam
EET 35 ;

(%) B (3) Wil Jarden RHReige o faeror amedge foen srgameme
VI AT, T TFHAT ¢ FeaR] R SgE SFEHEA S5

(M) G (F) Tefter THEer HuHmR, 39 foaRor dara S |el
FIUAT A,
(237) die-Fem () e faffee shetean featem foram e, —

(37) TRA= foeRoT WeY 7 shea, fhar

() demEdH Te faavomy RreERet 7 feear, o

() THETET TSR TERETe SEmeEe o T e, -
gfaa, e dA-aE 9 FREeEH TarEedd o feRer TR e, S J 3E
Ul - fafed holedl T, derEd e |Et He.”

(@) die-her () Ted, “ Terad | 7 a1 AR G gIvn=aT ST ¢ S
39T . 7 AT TSI GUOT=AT AT FSIHAUSSH, Jelol Holeh JRIel SH0ard ASet -




G RUR =
At =T FHih

WERTE YA AT, SHERUT HFT W7, HWHEZ 23, 2694 /5TauT 99, T Re¥e

“ o QiAdT, XISt 3 W ST {ohaT e, UsheR @ [qaRond e

XA TohaT oI ¥y GIell AUT=AT HIVRT Haearaadal @d aiauarEr fear df

FHHT FUATET TIIT SSA. AT FHARTEAT Ue-Therd () T Ui shetel! STddsheda
TRFAT U7 FRUATeAT feATeRTIEa STeN feeROTAR T AT 5.

(M) Ue-FHerd (R) T TEAT WA, © daEd At o faervr fHestearen

TSI S Afe=iea 311, TehaR 379N foaRone ” a1 AT, “ demad aradt 7em

TR W asTear 32 W ST foha AT, ST GURa 9 WReh foarumreAn aredid, o

0. TW IMUMEHIAT FHoIH &3 o, 1 FHotdrd Ue-FHed (1) 3T AdM FHHAS

3 o e SUAT A5 ST ST bR T hish feeiedn wie-sherd (R) R, qeiet Uie-Herd ST araet
a?azﬁw ETUDIG) ‘agg.[ [

G RUR =
AfataT FHih
3 9T o
¥4 =T RO,
ST ]
oI
AR

T Ro¢ =

“ () A1 TR WRUT et 3037-237 3T I ag fSeiel /et S7em e
3Tt 1 ol e VTRl debl, YR fohal e foeRor AR Ffadn Jgat. 3T
T YR Tohall TReh FeraoT, STo] el o Heb [eRoT el 3/ Tos qume e, demad
e foaRTd SuaTd Jger 31T g AT JUATT Aget, 37T 319 ok fohal Reh
foaRuT= FeYTd e &R T ARARl ol 3T, 7.

R, T AFEHEA FAT ¥y T, UiE-FHerd (237) ST gl

R () A AUFEEER GEROT Heted], TERTE AHUEd e A aRaard

FHE, T TSI X HIUATAT FASTHIAIST, AT v fohell 3 aiedier 319, a1 tfafammgR
GUROT hofedl 3o ST TR (a8 Teeiel SHivda! FeeT ST T

W, IT STHTEAT TR AR S ST SHeTdsl THI e 37T ot

SARIT HETIT IO TRl

() Te-HeH () 37T FEoiell Ui 3T, df Feeamcl I fqded daee, T

e ot TarEme Jauard I,

3. () HERT UHUEEA (GUROT F U8 9] S90T) STEARY, R0%¢ @, ABFNR, FRida

BRI AT et o1 3T,

A R AT
T a

(R) 3TN TR T o067 ST e, ST STEARINER GEROM FUI Seied] HeRTE

TN i st e AL FUATT ST HIUATET Pl fhalT HIOTAET HIEETET

(FIEUATT TeAeA! IVl SAegeT fohar fEetiet sTeer i) &, a1 SUFAER GURT Hug
FHEUAT 3Tetett TegerT fohar feeter TR STeare HFvaT JEa.

RR4R =

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR
SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD, PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI
ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS,
21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

g ¥, I’F &1 THET, AT 23, R0%¢/SMETT 33, Ik 2% 0 [ = ), fFma : ¥0@ R9.00

STHTERUT SHHTh ¢

TTTerhe ThTI

ERTE faurmesm Afuftaw T TSauTel et Feer SRy T hod fatrew s
fafer 7 =ma favrmega eetet fadas (FUs IaTE).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following translation
in English of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2017 (Mah. Act No. LIV of
2018), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

RAJENDRA G. BHAGWAT,

I/c. Secretary (Legislation) to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. LIV OF 2018.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Maharashtra Government Gazette”, on the 13th August 2018.)

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act.

WHEREAS the Governor of Maharashtra had promulgated the
Mah. Ord. Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter
XVIof2017. Loferred to as “the said Ordinance”) on the 19th July 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS the Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment) Bill,
2017 (L.A. Bill No. LVI of 2017) (hereinafter referred to as “the said Bill”) for
converting the said Ordinance into an Act of the State Legislature, was
Introduced in the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 10th August 2017 ;

®)
AT 3MB-RC—2



Short title and
commencement.

Amendment of
section 3 of ITI
of 1959.

TERTE JEE AU FHTEARUT AT A1, AR €3, 0%¢/3MEUT IR, Ik 2R¥0

AND WHEREAS as the session of the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly
was prorogued on the 11th August 2017, the said Bill could not be passed by
the Maharashtra Legislative Assembly ;

AND WHEREAS as provided by article 213(2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Ordinance would have ceased to operate on the 3rd September
2017 ;

AND WHEREAS it was considered expedient to continue the provisions
of the said Ordinance and, therefore, the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2017 (hereinafter referred to as
“the said Continuance Ordinance ”) was promulgated by the Governor of
Maharashtra on the 1st September 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS upon the re-assembly of the State Legislature on the
11th December 2017, the said Bill was passed with amendment by the
Maharashtra Legislative Assembly on the 19th December 2017 and
transmitted to the Maharashtra Legislative Council ;

AND WHEREAS the said Bill has been passed by the Legislative Council
with further amendments on the 22nd December 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS, before the amendments to the said Bill made by the
Maharashtra Legislative Council, could be considered by the Maharashtra
Legislative Assembly, the session of the Legislative Assembly was prorogued
on the 22nd December 2017 ;

AND WHEREAS, as provided by article 213(2)(a) of the Constitution of
India, the said Continuance Ordinance would have ceased to operate at the
expiration of six weeks from re-assembly of the State Legislature, that is,
after the 21st January 2018 ;

AND WHEREAS both Houses of the State Legislature were not in session;
and the Governor of Maharashtra was satisfied that circumstances existed
which rendered it necessary for him to take immediate action to continue
the operation of the provisions of the said Continuance Ordinance, for the
purposes hereinafter appearing; and, therefore, promulgated the Maharashtra
Village Panchayats (Amendment and Continuance) Ordinance, 2018

(hereinafter referred to as “the said Continuance Ordinance, 2018”) on the
20th January 2018 ;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient to replace the said Continuance
Ordinance, 2018 by an Act of the State Legislature ; it is hereby enacted in
the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows :(—

1. (I) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Village Panchayats
(Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 19th July 2017.

2. In section 3 of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Act”),—

(a) after clause (11AA), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(11 AAA) “member” means a member duly elected as a member of
panchayat under section 11 and include the Sarpanch of panchayat
elected directly under section 30A-1A;”;

Mah.
Ord.
XVIII

2017.

Mah.
Ord. II
of
2018.

IIT of
1959.



HERTZ IMEA SIS SATEIRVT WAT 36, AR 3, R0%¢/3MEUT RR, Wk R¥o 3

(b) in clause (17) after the word and figures “section 30” the figures,
letters and sign “, 30A- 1A” shall be inserted.

3. In section 7 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the following Amendment

sub-section shall be inserted, namely :— ;’Iflsegtliggg of
(0) .

“(3A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is elected
directly under section 30A-1A, unless otherwise provided in this Act,
all meetings of the Gram Sabha after each general election to a
panchayat, shall be presided over by the Sarpanch and in his absence
by the Upa-Sarpanch; and in absence of both Sarpanch and Upa-
Sarpanch, it shall be presided over by senior most member of panchayat
by age present in that meeting of the Gram Sabha. In case no member
of panchayat is present, the said meeting of the Gram Sabha shall be
adjourned for a period of one week, and such adjourned meeting shall
be presided over by Sarpanch and in his absence by Upa-Sarpanch and
in absence of both the Sarpanch and Upa-Sarpanch by the senior most
member of the panchayat by age present in the meeting of Gram Sabha.
In case no member of panchayat is present, such meeting shall be
presided over by an officer authorized by the Block Development Officer
in that behalf. ” .

4. In section 10 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following Amendment

sub-section shall be inserted, namely :— Oﬁfftigrllglég
(0) (0) .

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply
with the modifications that, in sub-section (1), in clause (a), before
sub-clause (i) the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely :(—

“(i-A) Sarpanch elected under section 30A-1A- ex officio member ;
and ”.”.

5. In section 13 of the principal Act, for sub-sections (1) and (2), the Amendment

following sub-sections shall be substituted, namely :— of section 13
of ITT of 1959.

“(1) Every person whose name is in the list of voters shall, unless
disqualified under this Act, or any other law for the time being in force,
be qualified to vote at the election of, a member for the ward to which
such list pertains and, Sarpanch of panchayat to be elected directly.

(2) Every person whose name is in the list of voters and who is not
less than 21 years of age on the last date fixed for making nomination
for every general election or bye-election shall, unless disqualified under
this Act, or under any other law for the time being in force, be qualified
to be elected for any ward of the village and for Sarpanch of panchayat.
No person whose name is not entered in the list of voters for such village
shall be qualified to be elected for any ward of the village and Sarpanch
of panchayat.

(2A) Every person who is not less than 21 years of age on the last
date fixed for making nomination for every general election or
bye-election and whose name is in the list of voters and who is born on
or after 1st January 1995, and who is not disqualified under this Act, or
under any other law for the time being in force shall, unless possesses
minimum 7th standard of school education passing certificate or acquired
educational qualification equivalent to 7th standard, as certified by the
competent authority, be qualified to be elected as Sarpanch.” .

AT TE-2¢—



¥

Amendment
of section 14
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 15
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 16
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 29
of III of 1959.

Amendment
of section 30
of III of 1959.

Insertion of
section 30A-
1A in IIT of
1959.

Direct
election of
Sarpanch.

TERTE JEE AU FHTEARUT AT A1, AR €3, 0%¢/3MEUT IR, Ik 2R¥0

6. In section 14 of the principal Act, in sub-section (I1),—

(Z) in clause (a), in sub-clause (iz), for the words “five years” the
words “six years” shall be substituted;

(i1) in clause (d), for the words “five years” the words “six years”
shall be substituted.

7. In section 15 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), after the word
and figure “section 11” the words, figures, letters and sign “or section 30A-
1A, as the case may be” shall be added.

8. In section 16 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words
“State Government” at both the places where they occur, the word
“Commissioner” shall be substituted.

9.In section 29 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words
“forward it to the Secretary” the words “forward it within seven days to the
Secretary” shall be substituted.

10. In section 30 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :(—

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is elected
directly under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply with
the following modifications :—

(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely :—

“(1) Every panchayat shall be presided over by a Sarpanch.”;
(b) sub-section (2) shall be deleted ;

(c) in sub-section (4), for the words “the members belonging to” the words
“persons belonging to” shall be substituted. ”.

11. After section 30, the following section shall be inserted, namely :—

“30A-1A. (1) After the date of commencement of the Maharashtra Village
Panchayats (Amendment) Act, 2017 in respect of the panchayat to which the
general election is to be held, subject to provisions of sub-sections (4), (5)
and (6) of section 30, every panchayat shall have a Sarpanch who shall be
elected by the persons whose names are included in the list of voters for
village under section 12.

(2) Election of the Sarpanch shall be held simultaneously with the
general elections of the panchayat and the procedure regarding holding of
elections to the panchayat shall, mutatis mutandis, apply to such election.

(3) If at an election, no Sarpanch is elected, a fresh election shall be
held to elect a Sarpanch, and if there is a failure to elect a Sarpanch at the
fresh election, such vacancy may, notwithstanding anything contained in
this Act, be filled by election by the elected members from amongst
themselves and the term of Sarpanch elected under this sub-section shall
be co-terminus with the term of members of the panchayat.

(4) Any person elected under sub-section (3) shall be deemed to be duly
elected at an election under this section.

Mabh.
LIV of
2018.



HERTZ IMEA SIS SATEIRVT WAT 36, AR 3, R0%¢/3MEUT RR, Wk R¥o

(5) If, in the election of the Sarpanch, there is an equality of votes, the
result of the election shall be decided by lots to be drawn by the State Election
Commissioner or the officer appointed by him for the purpose.

(6) In case of a dispute regarding election of the Sarpanch, the
provisions of section 15 shall, mutatis mutandis, apply. ” .

12. In section 30A of the principal Act,—

(a) after sub-section (1) the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected, the election of the Upa-Sarpanch shall be held in the first
meeting held after every general election. ” ;

(b) after sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be added,
namely :—

“(2A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected, the provisions of sub-section (3) of section 30 shall, mutatis
mutandis, apply in the case of Upa-Sarpanch.

13. In section 33 of the principal Act, after sub-section (5), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(6) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly elected
under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply with the
following modifications :—

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “election of Sarpanch and
Upa- Sarpanch” at both the places where they occurs, the words “election of
Upa-Sarpanch” shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(1A) The election of the Sarpanch shall be held in accordance with the
provisions of section 30A-1A of this Act.”;

(¢) in sub-section (2), after the words “presided over by” the words “the
Sarpanch and if the post of Sarpanch is vacant by” shall be inserted;

(d) in sub-section (3), the words “Sarpanch and” shall be deleted;
(e) for sub-section (4), the following sub-section shall be substituted,—

“(4) If, in the election of Upa-Sarpanch there is an equality of votes, the
Sarpanch shall have the right to exercise casting vote, and if the post of
Sarpanch is vacant, the result of elections shall be decided by lot drawn in
the presence of the officer presiding in such manner as he may determine.”;

() in sub-section (5),—
(i) the words “Sarpanch or” shall be deleted;

(i1) after the word, brackets and figure “ sub-section (1) ” the words
“Sarpanch or” shall be inserted.”.

14. In section 35 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following
sub-section shall be inserted, namely :—

“(1A) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly

elected under section 30A- 1A, the provisions of this section shall apply with
the following modifications:—

(@) in sub-section (1), for the words “one-third” the words “two-
third” shall be substituted,;
qT SE-2R¢— 3T

Amendment
of section 30A
of III of 1959.

Amendment of
section 33 of
IIT of 1959.

Amendment of
section 35 of
IIT of 1959.



Amendment

TERTE JEE AU FHTEARUT AT A1, AR €3, 0%¢/3MEUT IR, Ik 2R¥0

(b) in sub-section (3), for the portion beginning with the words “If
the motion” and ending with the words “against the Sarpanch;” the
following portion shall be substituted, namely :(—

“ If the motion of no-confidence is carried by a majority of not less
than three-fourth of the total number of the members who are for the
time being entitled to sit and vote at any meeting of the panchayat, the
Sarpanch or the Upa- Sarpanch, as the case may be, and ratified before
the special Gram Sabha by the secret ballot in the presence and under
the Chairmanship of the Officer appointed for the purpose by the
Collector, shall forthwith stop, exercising all the powers and, performing
all the functions and duties of the office and thereupon such powers,
functions and duties shall vest in the Upa-Sarpanch, in case the motion
is carried out against the Sarpanch ;”;

(c) for the fourth proviso, the following provisos shall be
substituted, namely :—

“Provided also that, no such motion of no-confidence shall be brought
within a period of two years from the date of election of Sarpanch or
Upa-Sarpanch and before the six months preceding the date on which
the term of panchayat expires :

Provided also that, if the no-confidence motion fails, then no motion

” »

shall be brought before the passage of time of next two years .”.

15. In section 38 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), after clause

of section 38 (7 the following clause shall be inserted, namely :(—

of III of 1959.

Amendment of

section 39 of

IIT of 1959.

Amendment
of section 43
of III of 1959.

“(i-a) in respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, the Sarpanch shall also exercise the
following powers, functions and duties,—

(a) finalise the agenda of panchayat meetings :

Provided that, if three or more members demands regarding
inclusion of any item on agenda for immediate next meeting, the
Sarpanch shall include the same in next meeting :

Provided further that, no ad-hoc financial business shall be
transacted unless it forms a part of the circulated agenda :

Provided also that, if the panchayat resolves on any subject
that is detrimental to the well-being of the village at large in the
opinion of Sarpanch, the Sarpanch shall cause the resolution to be
kept for final decision immediately in the next following Gram-
Sabha, and the decision of the said Gram Sabha shall be final ;

(b) prepare the annual budget of panchayat ;
(c) exercise all other powers to implement the schemes in
consultation with panchayat ; ”.

16. In section 39 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the words

five years” the words “six years” shall be substituted.

17. In section 43 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), after the

existing proviso, the following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided further that, the post of the directly elected Sarpanch
fallen vacant under this sub-section shall be filled in by election in the
manner laid down in section 30A-1A, within six months from the date of
such vacancy.”.



HERTZ IMEA SIS SATEIRVT WAT 36, AR 3, R0%¢/3MEUT RR, Wk R¥o

18. In section 49 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), in proviso,— Amendment
(i) before clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, 2;?;;?;111945%'

namely :—
“(al) the Sarpanch shall be the ex officio Chairman ; ” ;

(z1) after clause (f), the following clause shall be inserted,
namely :—

“(g) Gramsevak shall be ex officio Member- Secretary . ” .

19. In section 62 of the principal Act, after sub-section (1), the following Amendment

sub-section shall be inserted, namely :(— Oﬁﬁc‘dg?g%zg
(0) (0) .

“(1AA) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, the provisions of this section shall apply
with the following modifications :—

(a) for sub-sections (1) and (1A), the following sub-sections shall
be sustituted, namely,—

“(1) The Sarpanch shall determine annually on or before
5th January of every year in such form as may be prescribed, a
statement of,—

(a) the opening balance in the fund and estimated income
of the panchayat for the following financial year ;

(b) the expenditure proposed on establishment and
discharge of its duties under section 45 ;

(¢) the amount to be contributed to the District Village
Development Fund established under section 133 ;

(d) the statement made under clause (a), (b) or (¢), as the
case may be, shall be placed by the Sarpanch, before the
panchayat ;

(e) the panchayat shall in respect of the said statement,
finalise its recommendations on or before the 31st of January ;

() the statement along with the recommendation of the
panchayat under clause (e), shall be placed before the Gram
Sabha, which may ratify it on or before 28th of February ;

(g) after the decision of the Gram Sabha under clause (f),
the said statement shall be submitted to the Panchayat Samiti.

(1-A) If, on or before the date specified in sub-section (1),—
(a) the Sarpanch fails to submit the statement ; or

(b) the panchayat fails to make recommendation in respect of
the statement ; or

(c) the Gram Sabha fails to take decision in respect of
ratification of the recommendations,

the Secretary shall prepare the statement, regarding the
mandatory and office expenditure to be carried out and submit it
to the Panchayat Samiti in the form prescribed under the said sub-
section.”;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the portion beginning with words
“ The Panchayat Samiti ” and ending with words “ increased or
decreased: ” the portion “ The Panchayat Samiti shall, either
approve the statement or direct that the proposed expenditure on



¢ HERTZ IMEA IAAUA SAHTIRUT HAT A6, AR €3, 0%¢/SMEUT RR, Ih ¢R¥o

any of the duties falling under section 45 shall be increased or
decreased on or before 31st March of the every year. Expenditure
shall be carried out as per this statement till the date budgetary
process outlined in sub-section (1) of this section is completed:”

shall be substituted ;

(¢) in second proviso of sub-section (2), after the words “ be

«

increased or decreased” the words and figure “ on or before
31st March of every year and in case of revised and supplementary
statement ” shall be inserted. .
Amendment 20. Section 62A of the principal Act, shall be re-numbered as sub-section
f section 62A
Oofsﬁ(l: (1)(;11959' (1) of that section and after sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the following

sub-section shall be added, namely :—

“(2) In respect of the panchayat to which the Sarpanch is directly
elected under section 30A-1A, a Sarpanch may at anytime during the
financial year for which any such statement has been approved as
aforesaid cause a revised or supplementary statement to be prepared.
Every such revised or supplementary statement shall be considered
and approved by the Panchayat Samiti in the same manner as if it were
an original statement, and the provisions of section 62 shall apply in

relation to such revised or supplementary statement. ” .

Amendment 21. Insection 145 of the principal Act, sub-section (I A) shall be deleted.
of section 145
of ITT of 1959.
Power to 22. (1) If any difficulty arises in giving effect to the provisions of the
difﬁéﬂﬂvj Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, as amended by this Act, the State IIIof
1959.

Government may, by an order published in the Official Gazette, as the occasion
arises, make such provisions not inconsistent with provisions of the said
Act, as amended by this Act, as may appear it to be necessary or expedient

for purpose of removing the difficulty :

Provided that, no such order shall be made after the expiry of a period

of two years from the date of commencement of this Act.

(2) Every order made under sub-section (1) shall be laid, as soon as may

be, after it is made, before each House of the State Legislature.



HERTZ IMEA SIS SATEIRVT WAT 36, AR 3, R0%¢/3MEUT RR, Wk R¥o ]

Mah. 23. (1) The Maharashtra Village Panchayats (Amendment and Repeal of
Ord. II continuance) Ordinance, 2018, is hereby repealed. Mah. Ord. II
of 2018. of 2018 and
saving.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken
(including any notification or order issued) under the corresponding
III of Provisions of the Maharashtra Village Panchayats Act, as amended by the
1959. said Ordinance, shall be deemed to have been done, taken or issued, as the
case may be, under the corresponding provisions of the said Act, as amended

by this Act.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY I/C DIRECTOR SHRI MANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERY AND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 EDITOR : I/C DIRECTOR
SHRIMANOHAR SHANKAR GAIKWAD.



